RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

o <, 37 ¥o] HHER, AT 19, 033/ &, ITeh 938y [ge ¥, e : 502 2.00

3TETENUT ShHTeh 209

TTFeIghd AT

HERTE IMTEAT TR fefadi-ad aar shetet
(T Ueh, Teh- 37 3ATTUT Ueh-oF ATHEA UTAg shelel (MEH T 3T Aiedtaed ) fam a smawr.

Heger a o fawmr

HeE oo 033, faieh v AN, R033.

SIbECEN
HERTE STHIH He g Hiedl, ¢ &E.

SHHih STHIA-R0RR/M.5h.Q 00 /-2 . — HRNIT STHIH Hedel Hiadl, 2]&& (R&E Hal. 3. ¥ ) T hetd 3337
70T et 3¢, T Ve OISl STEehRi=n o carad THe shom= S Td SRR o e
“TERTSE ST Hedel (IRTEeIER avf-) 3T MTSUSe Y sheledl ST AATeRTeR - We Suiadid ohiol)
fm,302R " AL YERON FUARIS! HERIG IMEAT Wefiel F-1aW Hvar Aifsiel 8. 3o =l el 331
=1, Uie-shetw( 2 ) GR STeveeh SR, Tel 5w qd ufig shiuard sietel fed. —

g, A W, “HERTY ST FEe (NERER -3 ST AISugH U shetedl ST HHEeER
-2, e TR Y07 ) (FGERoM) fom,3033” 1 Mg,
R. ‘TR S Wegd (9NEeRR - ST WEqs USH holed] ST ANTEeeR avi-¢ Hel
T 301 ) 1, R0} (ST AMge ‘W s U Seei sheldll 3718, ) =1 R 3 Wedl Wietiel GEron
FOITT I e, —
(2) 3u-f7m () Wit “ATeqga HeH sholed” 31 HSTehauastt “ATeugeT- W sholedl e
ST TR, @ ST Hoo HoR TSI Teel 9 & eI, & Tt shielael Iuf sieaaid
[z I e ol [ R U S IO B
(R) Su-fm (%) wea, —
(7) TR ETeiiel TReh THI SHuaTd Id 3Ted :—

“Uq, ATEETER -3 STerdl AIRYS W holedl ITHH A S Suiaeor
OIS AT YR F. ¢ I e I 3T, ST Tehaull T I

AT T--202—2 (2)



TERTSE YITE IS STETEMNUT THT IR-o, |TE 19, 2033 /9 &, Tk 238y

TEHT=IAT (ST YT sheledl Haeh! B -HIvT HEl Sle3 ) =dedn Wlis, feaifeeni, st
ST STTeeTER -, &2t SUTaNuIT shivTdel 3TTeeT TRId shis YehuTR rerd.”

‘TR STUTET 3T Y, ANTEEIER o-3 3T27aT MTSUST UG sholedl STehid ST,
379N foaferd Fertolt Jos HeR SIS Uodel T J& chodTeAl fGehaiI & ol
SHIATE Ut SRS, TeRIEehR, ST SHHI< IREeER - Hedl TIaRo hivlde]

(R) T —

(31) uR=g (31)—

(%) TR IR (3) A SRefehrTed ‘A o’ o woTRAest ure 9w’ @
H31ep gded eV ¢|Y§(’1.

(R) TR SRAT (%) Aefier ToehTe e o’ a1 Forguerst Urer e’ 81 7efht
SRI HIUATT .
(&) uR=sg (9)—

(%) TR SRHI (3) AeiicT IMTRmed i o’ 1 HeThauast e o’ 21 Hefeh)
SRI HIUATT .

(R) TR SHHI (%) Fefie SferrTes i e’ A1 HThIuast “arer s’ 21 Aokt
SRI HIUATT .

3. 3% TqE HEmmeEe AT TR RIS ShuTaTad o ¥ BT avesvdrd ad 3T,

HERTGT TSI AT STCRMTER 9 A1aH,

G s,
AT 39 .



HERTEE ITTE TSTUS STETLOT T SR-, |IE 9, R033 /AT &, ITh 2%y 3

REVENUE AND FORESTS DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 27th March, 2023.

NOTIFICATION
MaHARASHTRA LAND REVENUE CODE, 1966.

No. Jamin-2021/C.R.170/J-1.— In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 29A and 328 of
the Maharashtra Land Revenue Code, 1966 (Mah. XLI of 1966) and of all other powers enabling
it in that behalf, the Government of Maharashtra, hereby makes the following rules to amend the
Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy Class-II and Leasehold lands into Occupancy
Class-I lands) Rules, 2019, the same having been previously published as required by sub-section (1)
of section 329 of the said Code, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy
Class-IT and Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands) (Amendment) Rules, 2023.

2. In rule 3 of the Maharashtra Land Revenue (Conversion of Occupancy Class-II and
Leasehold lands into Occupancy Class-I lands) Rules, 2019 (hereinafter referred to as “the
principal Rules”),—

(1) in sub-rule (1) for the words “leasehold basis” the words “leasehold basis, after
lapse of the period of five years from the date of commencement of actual use of land for
which the land was granted originally,” shall be substituted,;

(2) to sub-rule (4),—
(I) before the Table, the following provisos shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that, the Collector shall not pass any order to convert the Occupancy
Class-II land or leasehold land into Occupancy Class-I land in cases, where the
premium for such conversion exceeds rupees one crore unless prior approval of
the State Government (except the land granted to Co-operative Housing Society),
is obtained:

Provided further that, the Collector shall not pass any order to convert the
Occupancy Class-II land or leasehold land into Occupancy Class-I land only in
such cases where the period of five years from the date of commencement of actual
use of land for which the land was granted originally has lapsed.”;

(IT) in the Table,—
(a) in paragraph (A),—

(i) in column (3), in the heading, for the words “three years” the words
“five years” shall be substituted;

(i) in column (4), in the heading, for the words “three years” the words
“five years” shall be substituted;

(b) in paragraph (B),—

(1) in column (3), in the heading, for the words “three years” the words
“five years” shall be substituted;

(it) in column (4), in the heading, for the words “three years” the words
“five years” shall be substituted.



¥ TERTS I TSTIS SFHATLRUT ST SR-o, HIE /9, 2033/ &, Ik 238y

3. Rule 4 of the principal Rules relating to adjustment of premium shall be deleted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SUNIL KOTHEKAR,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



